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In 2005, historian Jason Emerson discovered a steamer trunk formerly owned by Robert Todd Lincoln's
lawyer and stowed in an attic for forty years. The trunk contained a rare find: twenty-five letters pertaining to
Mary Todd Lincoln's life and insanity case, letters assumed long destroyed by the Lincoln family. Mary
wrote twenty of the letters herself, more than half from the insane asylum to which her son Robert had her
committed, and many in the months and years after.

            The Madness of Mary Lincoln is the first examination of Mary Lincoln’s mental illness based on the
lost letters, and the first new interpretation of the insanity case in twenty years. This compelling story of the
purported insanity of one of America’s most tragic first ladies provides new and previously unpublished
materials, including the psychiatric diagnosis of Mary’s mental illness and her lost will.

Emerson charts Mary Lincoln’s mental illness throughout her life and describes how a predisposition to
psychiatric illness and a life of mental and emotional trauma led to her commitment to the asylum. The first
to state unequivocally that Mary Lincoln suffered from bipolar disorder, Emerson offers a psychiatric
perspective on the insanity case based on consultations with psychiatrist experts.

            This book reveals Abraham Lincoln’s understanding of his wife’s mental illness and the degree to
which he helped keep her stable. It also traces Mary’s life after her husband’s assassination, including her
severe depression and physical ailments, the harsh public criticism she endured, the Old Clothes Scandal,
and the death of her son Tad.

          The Madness of Mary Lincoln is the story not only of Mary, but also of Robert. It details how he dealt
with his mother’s increasing irrationality and why it embarrassed his Victorian sensibilities; it explains the
reasons he had his mother committed, his response to her suicide attempt, and her plot to murder him. It also
shows why and how he ultimately agreed to her release from the asylum eight months early, and what their
relationship was like until Mary’s death.

This historical page-turner provides readers for the first time with the lost letters that historians had been in
search of for eighty years.
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From reader reviews:

William Marquis:

Here thing why this The Madness of Mary Lincoln are different and dependable to be yours. First of all
studying a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content than it which is the content is as scrumptious as
food or not. The Madness of Mary Lincoln giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find
any reserve out there but there is no publication that similar with The Madness of Mary Lincoln. It gives you
thrill reading through journey, its open up your own eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is
maybe can be happened around you. You can bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your approach
home by train. In case you are having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of The
Madness of Mary Lincoln in e-book can be your substitute.

Craig Harrison:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book specially book entitled The
Madness of Mary Lincoln your thoughts will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect
that maybe unknown for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a
reserve then become one application form conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get before.
The The Madness of Mary Lincoln giving you a different experience more than blown away your head but
also giving you useful data for your better life within this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern
here is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning a casino game.
Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

Crystal Parrish:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this The Madness of Mary Lincoln reserve
written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that could be understand by anyone who
read the book. Written inside good manner for you, dripping every ideas and publishing skill only for
eliminate your hunger then you still uncertainty The Madness of Mary Lincoln as good book not merely by
the cover but also by content. This is one publication that can break don't assess book by its protect, so do
you still needing yet another sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense
already said so why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.

Corrine Steinke:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind talent or
thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book in comparison with
can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all of this time you only find e-book that need more
time to be learn. The Madness of Mary Lincoln can be your answer as it can be read by a person who have
those short spare time problems.
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