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From an incredible new voice in psychological suspense, a novel about the secrets that remain after a
final bohemian summer of excess turns deadly.

This taut psychological thriller begins when Karen and her nine-year- old daughter, Alice, pick up Rex from
a ten-year stint in prison for murder. Flash back to the sultry summer in 1990s London when Karen, a
straight-A student on the verge of college graduation, first meets the exotic, flamboyant Biba and joins her
louche life in a crumbling mansion in Highgate. She begins a relationship with Biba's enigmatic and
protective older brother, Rex, and falls into a blissful rhythm of sex, alcohol, and endless summer nights.
Naïvely, Karen assumes her newfound happiness will last forever. But Biba and Rex have a complicated
family history-one of abandonment, suicide, and crippling guilt-and Karen's summer of freedom is about to
end in blood.

When old ghosts come back to destroy the life it has taken Karen a decade to build, she has everything to
lose. She will do whatever it takes to protect her family and keep her secret. Alternating between the fragile
present and the lingering past with a shocker of an ending, The Poison Tree is a brilliant suspense debut that
will appeal to readers of Kate Atkinson, Donna Tartt, and Tana French.
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From reader reviews:

Helen Palmer:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading habit give you lot of
advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the book
in which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of e-book
you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want really
feel happy read one along with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The particular The Poison
Tree: A Novel is kind of book which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Patrick Pierce:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With studying you can get a
lot of information that could give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world could
share their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire all their reader with their
story or even their experience. Not only the story that share in the books. But also they write about the
information about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their
ability in writing, they also doing some study before they write to their book. One of them is this The Poison
Tree: A Novel.

Patricia Stewart:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will
make someone to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended to you personally is The Poison Tree: A Novel this guide consist a lot of the information on
the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented how can the world has grown up. The
dialect styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some investigation when he
makes this book. That is why this book suitable all of you.

Leroy Barker:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the
most beneficial book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is named
of book The Poison Tree: A Novel. You can include your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed
book, it can add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most significant that, you must
aware about reserve. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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